

00-16-39

IN THE MATTER OF ACCEPTANCE
OF BIDS FOR ROAD MATERIALS
USED IN ROAD MAINTENANCE
AND CONSTRUCTION

COPY FILED
2016 MAR 28 PM 4:46

ORDER

NOW, on this day, comes on for consideration by the Court the matter of the acceptance of bids received for the purchase of road materials pursuant to the provisions of Act 52 of the Acts of the General Assembly of the State of Arkansas for the year 1965, as amended, and the Court having been well advised as to all matters of fact and of law, makes the following findings and issues the following Orders:

I.

The Court has jurisdiction of the parties named and the subject matter.

II.

On Monday, March 21, 2016, Garland County accepted sealed bids for road construction and maintenance materials. The bids received are attached to this Order and marked as follows:

- Exhibit "A"- Coakley Company, Inc. (Oil, Hot Mix & Gravel Products) (Equipment & Labor)
- Exhibit "B"- Dirty Deeds Trucking (Oil, Hot Mix & Gravel Products) (Equipment & Labor)
- Exhibit "C"- James Bozeman, LLC. (Oil, Hot Mix & Gravel Products) (Equipment & Labor)
- Exhibit "D"- Martin Marietta Materials (Oil, Hot Mix & Gravel Products)
- Exhibit "E"- Cranford Construction Company (Oil, Hot Mix & Gravel Products)
- Exhibit "F"- Spa Construction Company, Inc. (Oil, Hot Mix & Gravel Products)
- Exhibit "G"- Contech Construction Products, Inc. (Metal, Concrete & Plastic Pipe Delivered)
- Exhibit "H"- Drainage Pipe, LLC (Metal, Concrete & Plastic Pipe Delivered)
- Exhibit "I"- HD Water Works (Metal, Concrete & Plastic Pipe Delivered)

Also attached to the Order is the Proof of Publication, marked as Exhibit "J", a copy of the Bid Notice, marked as Exhibit "K", a copy of the bid specifications, marked as Exhibit "L" and the Bid Tabulation forms, marked as Exhibits "M".

III.

Acceptance of the following bids has been determined to be in the best interest of Garland County:

Spa Construction Company, Inc. is awarded the bids for:

- Liquid Asphalt In Place: Prime Oil: MC-30 Primer and EPR-1 Primer
- Road Oil: CRS-2 Emulsion, CRS-2P Emulsion and CMS-1PC

Hot Mix Products In Place-Overlays:

- 1/2" Superpave Surface 2" (+1/2") D
- 3/8" Superpave Surface 1/5" (1/2") D

Cranford Construction Company is awarded the bids for:

- Hot Mix Products for Patching: 1/2" Superpave Surface (PG64-22)
- Bituminous Cold Mix Invert Emuls

Coakley Company, Inc., Dirty Deeds Trucking, James Bozeman, LLC and Martin Marietta Materials are all awarded the bids for: Gravel Products material and/ or delivery or county hauled on an as needed basis dependent of the location of the job within the County and material needed at the time.

Coakley Company, Inc, Dirty Deeds Trucking and Spa Construction Company, Inc., are all awarded the bids for Equipment and Labor Services on an as need basis depending on the job location and services required at any given time. To include emergency services during a declared natural disaster.

Contech Construction Products, Inc. is awarded the bids for:

Pipe: All Corrugated Metal Pipe: 16 Gauge (all sizes) and 14 Gauge (all sizes)
All Arch Metal Pipe: 14 Gauge (all sizes)

Drainage Pipe, LLC. is awarded the bids for:

Pipe: All Concrete Pipe-Reinforced (all sizes)
All Corrugated Exterior Plastic Pipe with smooth interior (12 inch-42 inch)

IV.

Prices offered in the bids approved and listed in Section III of this order shall be effective May 1, 2016.

IT IS THEREFORE, BY THE COURT CONSIDERED, ORDERED AND ADJUDGED that the bids listed in Section III of this Order are hereby accepted and approved.

IT IS SO ORDERED.



Rick Davis
County Judge

Date: 3-28-16

**2016 BIDS RECEIVED FOR ROAD MATERIALS INCLUDING
OIL, HOT MIX & GRAVEL PRODUCTS**

EXHIBIT " M "

VENDOR							
PRODUCT	COAKLEY CO.,INC	DIRTY DEEDS	JAMES BOZEMAN LLC	MARTIN MARIETA MATERIA	CRANFORD CONSTRUC CO	SPA CONSTRUC CO	
<u>LIQUID ASPHALT IN PLACE</u>							
PRIME OIL							
MC-30 PRIMER	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.06/GAL	
EPR-1 PRIMER	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.28/GAL	
ROAD OIL							
CRS-2 EMULSION	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.82/GAL	
CRS-2P EMULSION	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.26/GAL	
CMS-1PC	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.64/GAL	
<u>HOT MIX PRODUCTS IN PLACE-OVERLAYS</u>							
1/2" SUPERPAVE SURFCE 2"(+1/2") D	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$91.75/ton	\$79.62/TON	
3/8" SUPERPAVE SURFCE 1.5"(1/2") D	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$94.30/ton	\$81.62/TON	
<u>HOT MIX PRODUCTS FOR PATCHING</u>							
1/2" SUPERPAVE SURFACE (PG64-22)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$69.85/ton	NO BID	
BITUMINOUS COLD MIX INVERT EMULS.	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$105.00/ton	NO BID	
<u>GRAVEL PRODUCTS</u>							
1" CLEAN GRAVEL							
COUNTY HAULS	\$10.50/TON	\$10.50/TON	NO BID	\$17.75/TON	NO BID	NO BID	
DELIVERED	\$14.25/TON	\$14.00/TON	\$18.90/TON	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
SCREENED OVERSIZE ROCK 2"-4" (B STONE)							
COUNTY HAULS	\$7.50/TON	\$10.00/TON	NO BID	\$16.50/TON	NO BID	NO BID	
DELIVERED	\$11.25/TON	\$13.50/TON	\$18.75/TON	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
Page 1 of 2							

	VENDOR						
PRODUCT	COAKLEY CO.,INC	DIRTY DEEDS	JAMES BOZEMAN LLC	MARTIN MARIETA MATERIA	CRANFORD CONSTRUC CO	SPA CONSTRUC CO	
CITY PIT ROAD BASE 3" MINUS							
COUNTY HAULS	\$4.00/TON	\$4.00/TON	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
DELIVERED	\$7.75/TON	\$7.50/TON	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
SCREENED 1 1/2" MINUS							
COUNTY HAULS	\$7.50/TON	\$9.00/TON	NO BID	\$12.50/TON	NO BID	NO BID	
DELIVERED	\$11.25/TON	\$12.50/TON	\$18.25/TON	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
SCREENED FINED 3/8" MINUS							
COUNTY HAULS	\$2.50/TON	\$2.50/TON	NO BID	\$13.65/TON	NO BID	NO BID	
DELIVERED	\$6.25/TON	\$6.00/TON	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
SCREENED 1 1/2" CLEAN GRAVEL							
COUNTY HAULS	\$9.00/TON	\$10.25/TON	NO BID	\$16.75/TON	NO BID	NO BID	
DELIVERED	\$12.75/TON	\$13.75/TON	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
CRUSHED ROAD BASE CLASS 7 SB-2 AHTD STANDARDS							
COUNTY HAULS	NO BID	\$11.00/TON	NO BID	\$14.50/TON	NO BID	NO BID	
DELIVERED	NO BID	\$14.50/TON	\$16.90/TON	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
AHTD CLASS #2 STANDARD CHIPS							
COUNTY HAULS	NO BID	\$23.50/TON	NO BID	\$22.50/TON	NO BID	NO BID	
DELIVERED	NO BID	\$27.50/TON	\$26.50/TON	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
NON-SPEC SB-2 **							
COUNTY HAULS	\$7.00/TON	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
DELIVERED	\$10.75/TON	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
**PRODUCT NOT ON ORIGINAL BID SHEET							
Page 2 of 2							

**2016 BIDS RECEIVED FOR METAL, CONCRETE AND PLASTIC PIPE DELIVERED TO THE
GARLAND COUNTY ROAD DEPARTMENT**

DESCRIPTION	VENDORS					
	CONTECH CONSTR. PRODUCTS	DRAINAGE PIPE LLC	HD WATER- WORKS			
<i>CORRUGATED METAL PIPE- 16 GAUGE</i>				NO BID		
12 Inch	\$ 8.50	\$ 9.00				
15 Inch	\$ 10.20	\$ 11.00				
18 Inch	\$ 12.75	\$ 14.00				
24 Inch	\$ 16.15	\$ 18.00				
<i>CORRUGATED METAL PIPE- 14 GAUGE</i>				NO BID		
30 inch	\$ 25.50	\$ 27.00				
36 Inch	\$ 30.60	\$ 33.00				
48 Inch	\$ 40.80	\$ 45.00				
60 Inch	\$ 56.95	\$ 60.00				
72 Inch	\$ 68.85	\$ 78.00				
<i>ARCH METAL PIPE- 14 GAUGE</i>				NO BID		
12 Inch	N/A	\$ 11.00				
15 Inch	\$ 14.17	\$ 15.00				
18 Inch	\$ 17.00	\$ 18.00				
24 Inch	\$ 22.67	\$ 22.00				
30 Inch	\$ 28.33	\$ 28.00				
36 Inch	\$ 34.00	\$ 34.00				
48 inch	\$ 45.33	\$ 48.00				
60 Inch	\$ 63.28	\$ 85.00				
72 Inch	\$ 76.50	\$ 110.00				
<i>CONCRETE PIPE-ALL CONCRETE PIPE REINFORCED</i>				NO BID		
12 Inch	NO BID	\$ 9.70				
15 Inch	NO BID	\$ 12.00				
18 Inch	NO BID	\$ 14.50				
24 Inch	NO BID	\$ 21.00				
30 Inch	NO BID	\$ 31.10				
36 Inch	NO BID	\$ 47.00				
48 Inch	NO BID	\$ 72.00				
60 Inch	NO BID	\$ 105.00				
72 Inch	NO BID	\$ 162.00				

2016 BIDS-----EQUIPMENT & LABOR

EQUIPMENT	SIZE	COST	COAKLEY	DIRTY	SPA								
			CO., INC	DEEDS	CONSTRUCTI	ON							
CAT 312 Trackhoe or equal 29,000 lb.	90-100 HP	PER HOUR	\$ 65.00	NO BID	NO BID								
CAT 316 Trackhoe or equal 39,000 lb.	10-120 HP	PER HOUR	\$ 65.00	NO BID	\$ 100.00								
CAT320/323 Trackhoeorequal48,000lb	150-160 HP	PER HOUR	\$ 85.00	NO BID	NO BID								
CAT324/326 Trackhoeorequal55,000lb	190-200 HP	PER HOUR	\$ 110.00	NO BID	NO BID								
TrackhoeThumb attachforbrushremv		PER HOUR	\$ 15.00	NO BID	NO BID								
CAT 420 Backhoe or equal	80 - 90 HP	PER HOUR	\$ 50.00	NO BID	\$ 75.00								
CAT D-5g Dozier or equal	90 HP	PER HOUR	\$ 60.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00								
CAT D-6K Dozier or equal	125 HP	PER HOUR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID								
Tri-axle Dump Truck & Driver	18 cubic yds/min	PER HOUR	\$ 75.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 80.00								
Quad-axle Dump Truck & Driver	22 cubic yds/min	PER HOUR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID								
Truck w/Dump trailer & Driver	22 cubic yds/min	PER HOUR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID								
Patching Asphalt Roller	3 TON	PER HOUR	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 60.00								
Patching Asphalt Roller	6 TON	PER HOUR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID								
Smooth Drum Roller	60 "	PER HOUR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID								
Smooth Drum Roller	66"	PER HOUR	\$ 50.00	NO BID	NO BID								

EQUIPMENT	SIZE	COST	COAKLEY	DIRTY	SPA				
			CO., INC	DEEDS	CONSTRUC				
Smooth Drum Roller	84"	PER HOUR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID				
Pad Foot Roller	60"	PER HOUR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID				
Pad Foot Roller	66"	PER HOUR	\$ 50.00	NO BID	NO BID				
Pad Foot Roller	84"	PER HOUR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID				
12 m CAT Motor Grader or equal	14' blade	PER HOUR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID				
Pickup	3/4 ton	PER HOUR	\$ 20.00	NO BID	\$ 50.00				
Wheel Loader's	2.75-3.25 cubic yds	PER HOUR	\$ 80.00	NO BID	NO BID				
Wheel Loader's	3.25-4.50 cubic yds	PER HOUR	\$ 100.00	NO BID	NO BID				
LogLoaderTrk-mounted-dbris removal		PER HOUR	\$ 120.00	NO BID	NO BID				
CAT 216 Skidsteer or equal	50 - 80 HP	PER HOUR	\$ 45.00	\$ 70.00	NO BID				
CAT 279 Skidsteer or equal	80 - 100 HP	PER HOUR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID				
Water Truck	3,000 gallon	PER HOUR	\$90 (2500g)	NO BID	NO BID				
Self Loading Debris Removal Truck		PER HOUR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID				
Bucket Truck (insert yardageofremovaltrk;cy)		PER HOUR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID				
Paving Machine *		PER HOUR	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 100.00				
Large Moving Trucks*		PER HOUR	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 100.00				

Oil Distributor Truck*	PER HOUR	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 100.00	
Tandem Dump *	PER HOUR	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 70.00	
308 Cat Excavator w/thumb (65 HP) *	PER HOUR	\$ 60.00	NO BID	NO BID	
* Indicates equipment added by vendor and not listed on original bid sheet					
LABOR	COST	COAKLEY CO., INC	DIRTY DEEDS	SPA CONSTRUC	
SUPERINTENDENT	PER HOUR	\$ 48.00	\$ 25.00	NO BID	
	PER DAY	\$ 384.00	\$ 200.00	NO BID	
FOREMAN	PER HOUR	\$ 40.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 35.00	
	PER DAY	\$ 320.00	\$ 160.00	NO BID	
OPERATOR	PER HOUR	\$ 40.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 27.00	
	PER DAY	\$ 320.00	\$ 160.00	NO BID	
SKILLED LABORER	PER HOUR	\$ 30.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 27.00	
	PER DAY	\$ 240.00	\$ 144.00	NO BID	
LABORER	PER HOUR	\$ 25.00	\$ 17.00	\$ 27.00	
	PER DAY	\$ 200.00	\$ 136.00	NO BID	